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<endangbidayani@gmail.com> 

 
 

Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Sat, Feb 4, 2023 at 1:34 AM 

To: endangbidayani@gmail.com 

 
Dear Endang Bidayani, 

 

Thank you for your interest in publishing with us. 

 
I will be your editor and I will stay at your disposition for all the aspects concerning your manuscript. 

 
The editorial team will assess your manuscript and I will get back to you as soon as possible with the result. 

 
 

-- 

Kind regards, 

Eniko Kovacs 
AACL Bioflux Editor 

 

 

Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > Wed, Feb 15, 2023 at 11:03 AM 

To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 

 
Dear Editor 

Could we have any news or progress about our article?? 

Best regard 

Endang Bidayani  
[Quoted text hidden] 

 

Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 2:46 AM 

To: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > 

 
Dear Endang Bidayani, 

 

We would like to inform you that after the preliminary evaluation your paper is qualified for processing (reviewing). 

 
Before proceeding to the review, please consider that a processing fee of 300 USD is required. The average 

duration of the publication process is 10 weeks, but it can be reduced with a priority tax of 200 USD 
(http://www.bioflux.com.ro/journal/). 

 
Manuscript processing fee: 300 USD 

Manuscript processing fee with priority: 500 USD 

 
In case the manuscript is not published, the author or his/her institution is reimbursed (exceptions are made in the 
cases of poor feedback from authors or withdrawal/rejection due to multiple submissions). 

 
I will be your editor and I will stay at your disposition for all the aspects concerning your manuscript. 

 
Concerning the payment procedure, you will find all the details bellow and I would like to kindly ask you to send me 

the scanned receipt of the payment in order to start the publishing process. Upon reception of your payment 

receipt we will send you the invoice. 

 
Payment option: 

Beneficiary: 

Bioflux SRL 
City: Cluj-Napoca, 
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Country: Romania, European Union; 

SWIFT CODE of the bank: BTRLRO22 

Account USD: 

RO68BTRL01302202L28614XX 

 
Bank: 

BANCA TRANSILVANIA 
 

Important! When bank transfer is used to pay a publication fee, please choose the right option, which is “US”! 

(among the three options you have: Ben, Our, Us). 
The option “Us” means that all the transfer fees are at your charge. Please note that in case you do not specify 

the “Us” option, the payment will not be valid. 

 
We recommend not to send your manuscript to more than one editor, in order to avoid being double charged. 

Do not hesitate to contact me for any questions related to the process. 

Thank you for publishing with us! 

 
Kind regards, 
Eniko Kovacs 

AACL Bioflux Editor 
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Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > Thu, Mar 2, 2023 at 9:39 AM 

To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 

 
Dear Editor 

 
I sent you a payment proff of our article for 300 USD, pl find the proff attached, and please let us know when you got 

the payment 

 
 

Best regards 

 Endang Bidayani 
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Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Fri, Mar 3, 2023 at 12:14 AM 

To: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > 

 
Dear Endang Bidayani, 

 

Thank you for the payment. We will further process your manuscript and get back to you with the reviewer’s 

feedback. 
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Kind regards! 

 
[Quoted text hidden] 

 

Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Sat, Mar 25, 2023 at 2:31 PM 

To: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > 

 
Dear Endang Bidayani, 

The reviewers returned the manuscript and request a major revision, before being able to proceed further. 

Thank you. 

[Quoted text hidden] 
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Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Fri, Apr 14, 2023 at 12:34 AM 

To: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com >, "zoobiomag2004@yahoo.com" <zoobiomag2004@yahoo.com> 

 
Dear Endang Bidayani, 

 
There seem to be some issues regarding the payment, as we have still not received it, despite the fact that you sent 

us the slip on the 2nd of March. Could you please check with your bank? 

 
Thank you. 

 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > 

 Date: Thu, Mar 2, 2023 at 4:39 AM 

Subject: Re: AACL Bioflux 

To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 
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To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 

Cc: "zoobiomag2004@yahoo.com" <zoobiomag2004@yahoo.com> 

 
Yes, I will check 

thanks for the information 

 
Best regards 

[Quoted text hidden] 

 

Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > Thu, Apr 27, 2023 at 10:43 AM 

To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 

 
Dear editor, did you have our payment, we've got the invoice from AACL Bioflux, 

[Quoted text hidden] 
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Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Sat, Apr 29, 2023 at 2:40 AM 

To: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > 

 
Dear Dr. Endang Bidayani, 
We received the payment. 

 
Thank you. 

[Quoted text hidden] 
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 Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > Sat, Apr 29, 2023 at 10:12 AM 

To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 

 
Dear Editor 

Pl find our revision paper attached, 

Best regards 

Endang Bidayani  
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Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > Wed, May 3, 2023 at 2:19 PM 

To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 

 
Dear Editor, 

we need this article to be published soon this month, can we have Manuscript processing with priority? 

 
Best regards 

Endang Bidayani 

[Quoted text hidden] 

 

Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Thu, May 4, 2023 at 1:43 AM 

To: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > 

 
Dear Dr. Endang Bidayani, 

 

The authors did not improve the manuscript, as requested: "the scientific methodology and content of the article 
need to be substantially improved: the hypothesis formulation, the data collection methodology (which cannot be 
evaluated, in absence of information), the results presentation, the statistics on the data and hypothesis 
validation, etc. The argumentation in incomplete and it lacks of coherence. As it is, the manuscript is not 
publishable and a major revision is required for improving it according to the scientific standards" 
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Please take into consideration and implement the requirements, as it is, the manuscript is not publishable, it all 
depends on the authors when the manuscript could be published. All changes must be highlighted with yellow. 

 

Thank you. 
[Quoted text hidden] 
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Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > Fri, May 5, 2023 at 7:29 AM 
To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 

 
Dear Editor, 

Pl find our revised manuscript attached, 

Best wishes 

Endang Bidayani  

[Quoted text hidden] 
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Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Tue, May 9, 2023 at 12:13 AM 

To: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > 

 
Dear Dr. Endang Bidayani, 

 
Please find the manuscript attached and make the necessary adjustments. 
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Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > Tue, May 9, 2023 at 8:30 PM 

To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 
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Dear Editor 

I sent a final paper of our article, pl find the attachment 

Best regards 

Endang Bidayani  
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Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Wed, May 10, 2023 at 11:46 PM 

To: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > 

 
Dear Dr. Endang Bidayani, 

 
Please find the manuscript attached and make the necessary adjustments. 
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Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > Thu, May 11, 2023 at 3:12 PM 

To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 

 
Dear Editor 

Pl find our revised paper attached 

best regards 

Endang Bidayani  
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Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Fri, May 12, 2023 at 11:52 PM 

To: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > 

 
Dear Dr. Endang Bidayani, 

 
Could you please check the final form of the article attached, some adjustments were operated. 

 
If you have any final observations and instructions prior to the article publishing, please inform us, any changes 
should be clearly highlighted. Change requests cannot be considered after publishing the material. 

 
If all the authors agree with the final form of the article, could you please send us your acceptance for publishing,  

signed by all the authors. It should contain the title, name of the authors, a few lines stating that all the authors agree 

with the publishing, signature of all the authors. 
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To: Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> 

 
Dear Editor, 
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All the author agree with the final form of the article and approved to be published to Aquaculture, Aquarium, 

Conservation & Legislation - International Journal of the Bioflux Society. pl find our acceptance for publishing attached 

 
Best Regards 

Endang Bidayani 
[Quoted text hidden] 
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Eni Kovacs <ek.bioflux@gmail.com> Sun, May 14, 2023 at 3:32 PM 

To: Endang Bidayani < endangbidayani@gmail.com > 

 
Dear Dr. Endang Bidayani, 

 

We would like to inform you that your manuscript has been published: 

 
http://www.bioflux.com.ro/docs/2023.1277-1283.pdf 

 

Thank you for publishing with us and best of luck in your future research. 
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